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From:  
Sent: Tuesday, 6 July 2021 9:06 PM

Economics and Governance Committee
Re: Public Health and other legislation (Further extension of Expiring Provisions) 
Amendment Bill 2021".

To:
Subject:

Hello 

I am contacting you as an individual, as a Queensland resident in the Brisbane electorate.  

Myself and many others are concerned about the amendments as well as the continuation being made by the 
QLD state Governments to the Public Health Act. I have read this document on your website titled: " Public 
Health and other legislation (Further extension of Expiring Provisions) Amendment Bill 2021". 

The powers that you are planning to continue and the new amendments, including to "delegate" roles and 
decision making powers to unknown parties is totally unacceptable and draconian. 

In particular I note the Amendment of Covid 19 Emergency Response Act. Part 4. On page 40. Clause 8 
will extent our 'state of emergency' until 30 April next year. This gives you an overriding power to continue 
to administer experimental vaccines to the QLD public, while taking no liability for the side effects, both 
short and long term. Under normal circumstances and this behaviour would break state, federal and 
international laws. 

There are many reasons why your current proposals are serious and unprecedented. Granting the state even 
more powers to control the freedoms of Queenslanders is another dangerous precedent to set, especially as 
there has been no discussion of this publicly. This has obviously been planned for some time and is not at all
a proportional response to real circumstances on the ground- specifically the danger of Covid itself, which 
appears instead to be only the pretext for your plans. 

Many people are concerned about the climate of fear that both the government and media have put the 
Australian public in. You continue to incrementally take our freedoms and we do not believe you will give 
any of them back in full, but only create new conditions which we will have to meet, in order to get back 
small parts of our freedoms. 

We understand only ONE person has died from Covid in 2021 and positive case numbers are very small, 
given the amount of tests and the number of positive cases per population. This Bill is not justified to 
continue and is out of proportion to the problem of Covid. Thousands of people die per month from many 
issues such as heart disease, cancer or car accidents unfortunately and Covid is a only a tiny proportion of 
that. Most people are not even in a demographic group at risk, especially children and young people. Almost 
zero children have been I'll or died from Covid and we are evry suspicious that there is now being seeded 
warnings of mutations which children are suddenly vulnerable to. The PCR tests which this whole situation 
relies upon are not accurate given the number of repetitions set per test, and the test not being a diagnostic 
tool in the first place. The conditions of these tests is outrageous, in car parks for example and not in labs 
where they were designed to be used only. We have not been presented clear data and comparison of 
positive and false positive cases, instead the media do not report the outcome of many of these 'positive' 
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persons. Most in fact are asymptomatic. It appears as thought most of the lockdowns were justified by these 
asymptomatic cases. 

Traditionally pandemic were measured in death counts and not positive cases. Covid-19 is the opposite. 

The Australian Publics personal data is at serious risk of being shared and our privacy will erode further 
with such terrible amendments.  

The powers of control and "compliance" will only increase and the citizens are not factored in to this Bill, to 
have their say in any of these processes. We are already suppressed on social media and do not have 
representation in the main stream media, to question government or media propaganda. Experts change their 
opinion with the wind and often contradict each other as well as the government departments they represent. 
This climate of confusion can be used to take advantage of the public's fear. 

Our lives will continue to suffer as we struggle to work and survive, these new restrictions will not help. 
Singapore has changed its entire approach to covid and this is an example which should be on the table. 
There has been no public debate about what actions to take and what risks the public are willing to take- it's 
highly likely most people would accept the risk of life going back to normal, especially as the recovery rate 
for almost all groups is over 99%, if they get covid.  

These amendments make it easier for government and your representatives to act without our normal 
protections being in place and the normal procedures to correct for any of your mistakes. There is no 
accountability.  

The problems will increase as it appear that mandatory vaccines will only be a few months away and many 
people are worried about the experimental nature of such vaccines. There are no longitudinal tests or data to 
establish if they are safe, over years of generations. This is an unprecedented situation which had never been 
addressed by our current ruling politicians, instead it takes One Nation, Craig Kelly and George Christensen 
to recognise our concerns.  

We the Australian public were not asked if we wanted to be trapped in long term contracts with foreign 
Pharmaceutical companies, stuck with new gene therapy "vaccines" and importantly without the alternative 
of a classical vaccine- which would have been significantly lower cost and burden for the Australian public 
to fund. We got no saw in jumping on board this new fad of Mrna bio-technology. The Australian public 
have a right to know what is it these contracts, how much our governments have spent and how long we are 
obligated to foreign pharmaceutical companies.  

I ask for a reply to this email and a reply to all the contact you get about this Bill. It is fair and appropriate to 
demonstrate transparency and change your current approach to making amendments to suit your own needs 
as a State Government 

My full name is Ryan Will Daffurn and my address is  

Sincerley, 

Ryan Daffurn  
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